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Bid Awarded To:

IN\?

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
INVITATION TO BID/QUOTATIONS - SUMMARY

PO Box 3300
Danville, Virginia 24543
Phone # 434-799-6528

Purchase Order:
Date: April 14,2025 Department: Traffic Control Shop
Invitation Number/Name: RFQ Q004103 Person Eric Grabowski
Title: White and Yellow Paint for Paint Truck Completing Form:  Carrie Conner
Beyond Contracts LLC Motion Industries Inc PPG
Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
White 55 gallon barrels/drums traffic paint VDOT specifications. Deliovered to traffic
1 30 BL shop $170,000.00 $170,000.00 $1,439.624 $43,188.72 $774.40 $23,232.00
Yellow 55 gallon barrels/drums traffic paint VDOT specifications. Delivered to traffic
2 30 BL shop $1,439.62 $43,188.72 $774.40 $23,232.00
3 1 EA Freight No Bid No Bid $2,000.00 $2,000.00 No Bid No Bid
$170,000.00 $88,377.44] $46.464.00
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Bid Awarded To:
Date:
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CITY OF DANVILLE

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

INVITATION TO BID/QUOTATIONS - SUMMARY

Purchase Order:

PO Box 3300

Danville, Virginia 24543

Phone # 434-799-6528

April 14,2025 Department: Traffic Control Shop
Invitation Number/Name: RFQ Q004103 Person Eric Grabowski
Title: White and Yellow Paint for Paint Truck Completing Form:  Carrie Conner
Quantum Concierge Services LLC The Sherwin-Williams Company TransCor Supply
Item Quantity Unit Description Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension
White 55 gallon barrels/drums traffic paint VDOT specifications. Deliovered to traffic
1 30 BL shop $853.00 $25,590.00 $632.50 $18,975.00 $13.06 $21,549.00
Yellow 55 gallon barrels/drums traffic paint VDOT specifications. Delivered to traffic
2 30 BL shop $853.00 $25,590.00 $632.50 $18,975.00 $13.06 $21,549.00
3 1 EA Freight No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $650.00 $650.00
$51,180.00 $37,950.00 $43,748.00
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